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DSP Integrated Circuits establishes the essential interface between theory of digital signal processing
algorithms and their implementation in full-custom CMOS technology. With an emphasis on techniques for
co-design of DSP algorithms and hardware in order to achieve high performance in terms of throughput, low
power consumption, and design effort, this book provides the professional engineer, researcher, and student
with a firm foundation in the theoretical as well as the practical aspects of designing high performance DSP
integrated circuits. Centered around three design case studies, DSP Integrated Circuits thoroughly details a
high-performance FFT processor, a 2-D Discrete Cosine Transform for HDTV, and a wave digital filter for
interpolation of the sampling frequency. The case studies cover the essential parts of the design process in a
top-down manner, from specification of algorithm design and optimization, scheduling of operations,
synthesis of optimal architectures, realization of processing elements, to the floor-planning of the integrated
circuit.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Green:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for us to
find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or goal; it means that guide has different type.
Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They are reading whatever they take
because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like studying a book? Sometime,
man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well, probably you will need
this DSP Integrated Circuits.

Elida Allman:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book DSP Integrated Circuits. You can choose the best book if
you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important the book DSP Integrated Circuits.
You can add expertise and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can recognize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About
simple point until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, you can open a book or even
searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to the library.
Let's read.

Bobby Tremblay:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To
be sure that book is very important for all of us. The book DSP Integrated Circuits has been making you to
know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The
guide DSP Integrated Circuits is not only giving you much more new information but also being your friend
when you really feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship
together with the book DSP Integrated Circuits. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some
books.

Jennifer McNab:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This kind of book DSP Integrated Circuits was bright colored
and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book DSP Integrated Circuits has many kinds or
style. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel that you are
the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun
and chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading which.
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