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"Love at first sight is something for fairy tales. It doesn't last in real life."

Olivia Statler hates Logan Hayes. It's not the fact that he's an executive of a rival travel company, or the fact
that he's trying to buy her company, or even the fact that he won't leave her alone. Two years ago, the two of
them seemed to have something that was amazing and real, but Logan's ego got in the way.

When a new resort offers her an all-expense-paid trip to woo new clients, she figures that a working vacation
is just what she needs. As the youngest CEO in the travel business, she's honored and flattered. However, she
isn't the only executive that the resort invited. When Olivia sees the broad shoulders and blonde hair of
Logan Hayes, her heart races. Half of it is raw sexual attraction, half of it is anger at what he did to her.

Logan is determined to reignite their past spark, but Olivia does everything possible to avoid him. However,
a hurricane strikes and traps them on the island, making it impossible to ignore the changed man in front of
her. Only a storm as powerful as their passion will show them love or hate. Can romance survive the storm –
or will their hurricane kisses be swept away forever?

“Everything you hate was done by my father. I don't want your company.” His brown eyes were flames, and
my soul was the moth. I couldn't have escaped from his gaze if I had been blinded. He moved close enough
that those eyes were all I could see. “I want you.”

I blinked twice. That was not what I was expecting. His words startled and excited me, but before my brain
could analyze and process them, his hand was around the back of my neck and his lips were on mine.

His mouth was hot and insistent as he pressed it against mine. I fought for a moment, but his grip was too
strong and his kiss too sweet. It was a kiss I had craved for two years and had tried to convince myself I
could do without. I wanted to give in to him completely, but I was still too angry to budge even an inch.
Instead, I just stood there like a statue as he kissed me. I was furious and turned on beyond anything I could
imagine. After a moment, he pulled back and searched my face.

“What was that for?” I surprised myself with the amount of venom in my voice. His kiss had sent want
scorching down into the very marrow of my bones, but I needed someone to be angry with, and he was the
closest person. He had hurt me. His eyebrows came together above those beautiful eyes. Hope fell as he saw
something in my expression that disappointed him.

Without thinking, I put my hand on the back of his neck and pressed my mouth into his. He didn't hesitate,
kissing me back with a need that matched my own. He pushed me up against the wall. Our tongues
interlocked as we found the valve for the sexual tension that had been building between the two of us for the
past two years. My body responded to his every touch with a fervor I couldn't contain. Didn't want to
contain. I wanted it to consume us both...
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Sandoval:

The book Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) make you feel enjoy for
your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can to be your best friend
when you getting pressure or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make reading a book
Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) to get your habit, you can get a lot
more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. It
is possible to know everything if you like open up and read a reserve Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love
Story (The Kisses Series Book 5). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia
or some others. So , how do you think about this book?

Christopher Price:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by simply
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stay than other is high. For you who want
to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses
Series Book 5) book as starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than
just a book.

Mary Crist:

The experience that you get from Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) is a
more deep you digging the information that hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The
Kisses Series Book 5) giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood through anyone who read that because the author of this e-book is well-known
enough. This kind of book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then
can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this
particular Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) instantly.

Sue Joseph:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is called
of book Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5). You'll be able to your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make an individual
happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other
place.



Download and Read Online Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love
Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) Krista Lakes #0S54UG98BZY



Read Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series
Book 5) by Krista Lakes for online ebook

Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) by Krista Lakes Free PDF d0wnl0ad,
audio books, books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book
reviews epub, read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to
read, top books to read Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) by Krista
Lakes books to read online.

Online Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) by Krista
Lakes ebook PDF download

Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) by Krista Lakes Doc

Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) by Krista Lakes Mobipocket

Hurricane Kisses: A Billionaire Love Story (The Kisses Series Book 5) by Krista Lakes EPub


