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This book outlines a functorial theory of integral models of (mixed) Shimura varieties and of their toroidal
compactifications, for odd primes of good reduction. This is the integral version, developed in the author's
thesis, of the theory invented by Deligne and Pink in the rational case. In addition, the author develops a
theory of arithmetic Chern classes of integral automorphic vector bundles with singular metrics using the
work of Burgos, Kramer and Kühn. The main application is calculating arithmetic volumes or "heights" of
Shimura varieties of orthogonal type using Borcherds' famous modular forms with their striking product
formula--an idea due to Bruinier-Burgos-Kühn and Kudla. This should be seen as an Arakelov analogue of
the classical calculation of volumes of orthogonal locally symmetric spaces by Siegel and Weil. In the latter
theory, the volumes are related to special values of (normalized) Siegel Eisenstein series. In this book, it is
proved that the Arakelov analogues are related to special derivatives of such Eisenstein series. This result
gives substantial evidence in the direction of Kudla's conjectures in arbitrary dimensions. The validity of the
full set of conjectures of Kudla, in turn, would give a conceptual proof and far-reaching generalizations of
the work of Gross and Zagier on the Birch and Swinnerton-Dyer conjecture. Titles in this series are co-
published with the Centre de Recherches Mathématiques.
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From reader reviews:

Irving Gaston:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice simply by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while
is reading. Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is
high. For you who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of The Geometric and Arithmetic
Volume of Shimura Varieties of Orthogonal Type (CRM Monograph) book as starter and daily reading
publication. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Elsie Port:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel happy read
one having theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The particular The Geometric and Arithmetic
Volume of Shimura Varieties of Orthogonal Type (CRM Monograph) is kind of book which is giving the
reader unstable experience.

Allison Morales:

The particular book The Geometric and Arithmetic Volume of Shimura Varieties of Orthogonal Type (CRM
Monograph) will bring that you the new experience of reading the book. The author style to clarify the idea
is very unique. In the event you try to find new book to study, this book very suited to you. The book The
Geometric and Arithmetic Volume of Shimura Varieties of Orthogonal Type (CRM Monograph) is much
recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can easier to
read the book.

Debra Davin:

This The Geometric and Arithmetic Volume of Shimura Varieties of Orthogonal Type (CRM Monograph) is
completely new way for you who has interest to look for some information given it relief your hunger
associated with. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having
little bit of digest in reading this The Geometric and Arithmetic Volume of Shimura Varieties of Orthogonal
Type (CRM Monograph) can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this kind of
book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by
anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in publication form make
them feel tired even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a reserve especially this
one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the idea! Just read



this e-book sort for your better life along with knowledge.
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