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An in-depth investigation of a beloved food, a celebration of the complexity of simple pleasures, and a
delight for everyone who eats pasta.

Everyone loves pasta, but despite myriad cookbooks no one has ever seen the world’s favorite food
presented like this. Created by a team of obsessive designers, this unique book reveals the hidden
mathematical beauty that cooks across the globe have taken for granted since Marco Polo.

Pasta’s wonderful, sometimes whimsical, geometrical shapes and surfaces are designed to hold certain
sauces or accompaniments, to be beautiful yet functional. Here are over ninety forms of pasta, each shown
through especially commissioned photographs, mathematical formulae that accurately describe each shape,
and drawings that reveal the hidden genius of our everyday food. Brief texts describe the special attributes of
each form of pasta, along with advice on specific uses in cooking. 90 full-color photographs and 200 black-
and-white illustrations
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From reader reviews:

Stefanie Roach:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Pasta by Design. All type of
book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Yadira Singh:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family members or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read
any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every
day to reading a guide. The book Pasta by Design it is rather good to read. There are a lot of individuals who
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space
to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from your smart
phone. The price is not to fund but this book offers high quality.

Tina McKinney:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but novel and Pasta by Design as well as others sources were given
understanding for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science
book was created for teacher or students especially. Those books are helping them to add their knowledge. In
other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes Pasta by Design to make your spare time more
colorful. Many types of book like this one.

Piedad Trainor:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that
question was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different
hobby. And you also know that little person such as reading or as reading become their hobby. You should
know that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include
you knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to something
by book. Many kinds of books that can you take to be your object. One of them are these claims Pasta by
Design.
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