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Growing up in the small coastal town of Florida, Grayson Blackwood has defied the odds stacked against
him. Appearances on the outside can be very deceiving. Coming from a wealthy family with an abusive
father that won’t ever change, he’s determined to be a better man. Grayson is fighting for his family, his
country, and the only woman he’s ever loved.

Ella Anderson has lived a hard life, growing up with a sick mom and a less than upstanding father. From
hand-me-downs to food stamps, life was never easy for her family. But the one thing she could always count
on was her family’s love, and for Ella, that was the most precious commodity.

When Ella moves to Lakeview, she meets Grayson in high school. The attraction is immediate for both.
Dubbed as ‘just friends’, Grayson and Ella forge an undeniable friendship that leads to a powerful promise.

After high school, Ella and Grayson fall out of touch. A one-in-a-million chance meeting halfway around the
globe brings the couple back together in a lifeless desert land, a combat zone where death is always present.

Alpha in his own right, Captain Blackwood leads his special ops team into a war-torn country, determined to
take down a terrorist, while Ella struggles with the realization that Grayson has found her again.

Will their love survive time and their harsh separation from long ago? Can Grayson show Ella that they were
made for each other?

Bluebirds mate for life. And Grayson’s Bluebird is coming home.

***Author’s Note: This is a full-length standalone novel with a happily ever after ending and no
cliffhanger.  Due to strong language and sexual content, this book is not intended for readers under the age of
18.***  
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From reader reviews:

Johnny Allen:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with their story or their
experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data about
something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children,
there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their ability in
writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Grayson (This is Our
Life Book 1).

Jacqueline Gore:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family members or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a book. The book Grayson (This is Our Life Book 1) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a
lot of individuals who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did
not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read
this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high quality.

Freddy Lamberth:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Grayson (This is Our Life Book 1)
which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Teresa Laureano:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book Grayson (This is Our Life Book 1) was colorful
and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Grayson (This is Our Life Book 1) has many kinds
or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel
that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading in which.
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