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"The one thing for which this century will be remembered 500 years from now was: This was the century
when we began the exploration of space."-- Arthur M. Schlesinger

Tributes to Moonport: A History of Apollo Launch Facilities and Operations

"A thorough account of the complex scientific, engineering, and managerial efforts that undergirded the
astounding events that the National Aeronautics and Space Administration carried out."--Journal of
American History

"Another simply superb NASA official history. . . . Construction, administration, and technology are
carefully interwoven in an unusually candid and frank treatment of the history of America’s first lunar
launching facility."--Aerospace Historian

Gateway to the Moon presents the definitive history of the origins, design, and construction of the lunar
launch facilities at Kennedy Space Center, the terrestrial site of one of the greatest national adventures of the
20th century, humanity’s first trip to the moon. It includes archival illustrations and diagrams of locations,
personnel, and equipment, from aerial views of sandy, undeveloped Cape Canaveral to some of the first
photos of the mobile launchers and crawler-transporters.

Filled with the sense of wonder and pride that the earliest U.S. space achievements inspired, the book
focuses on launch complexes 39A and 39B, the gigantic assemblies from which the Apollo-Saturn vehicles
departed for trips into space, and on the massive eight-acre Vertical Assembly Building (renamed the
Vehicle Assembly Building) and the attached Launch Control Center—some of the most awesome buildings
ever constructed. It also analyzes the technological and governmental interactions necessary to ensure
success of the launches.

Originally part of Moonport, one of the volumes of the NASA History Series, the book is based on extensive
interviews with participants in the space program and wide  access to official documents, letters, and
memoranda; in addition, the authors air criticisms directed at the Kennedy Space Center team and treat in
detail mistakes in launch operations and conflicts within the program. Written for a general-interest
audience, with jargon and acronyms translated into everyday language, the book offers a faithful account of
technology in service to humanity.

Charles D. Benson, a retired colonel of the U.S. Army, is the coauthor of the official history of the Skylab
orbital workshop.

William B. Faherty, director of the Museum of the Western Jesuit Missions in Hazelwood, Missouri, retired
professor of history at St. Louis University, and archivist emeritus of the Midwest Jesuit Archives, is the
author of 25 books, including the historical novel The Call of Pope Octavian.
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Garrison:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire all their reader with their story as well
as their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about advantage about
something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young ones, there
are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their talent in
writing, they also doing some research before they write to the book. One of them is this Gateway to the
Moon.

Mary May:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get great
deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer can unlimited right. Then
ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book
you have read is definitely Gateway to the Moon.

Rita Beatty:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Gateway to the Moon reserve written by
well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who read the
book. Written inside good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your
own personal hunger then you still hesitation Gateway to the Moon as good book not only by the cover but
also by content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing
another sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so why
you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Ronald Ruggles:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen need book to know the update information of year to help year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. Through
the book Gateway to the Moon we can acquire more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? Being
creative person must like to read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't
always be doubt to change your life with this book Gateway to the Moon. You can more desirable than now.
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