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Anna Karenina fu pubblicato per la prima volta nel 1877. Era già stato pubblicato a puntate dal 1875, ma non
fu mai pubblicata l'ottava parte perché la rivista non tollerò le prese d posizione antinazionaliste di Tolstoj,
che fu quindi costretto a pubblicare l'opera completa a sue spese.Tolstoj vedeva in questo libro, considerato
un capolavoro del realismo, il suo primo vero romanzo. Sebbene la maggior parte della critica russa
stroncasse il romanzo fin dalla prima pubblicazione, definendolo "un romanzo frivolo dell'alta società,
secondo Dostoevskij "Anna Karenina in quanto opera d'arte è la perfezione...e niente della letteratura
europea della nostra epoca può esserle paragonato.Musiche originali di Ivan Genesio.

Please note: This audiobook is in Italian.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Crider:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book called Anna Karenina
[Italian Edition]? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time
using your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you
have different opinion?

Scott Frew:

The book Anna Karenina [Italian Edition] can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book Anna Karenina [Italian
Edition]? A number of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim which book can give many
info for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take
for that, you are able to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Anna Karenina [Italian Edition]
has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous
world by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Lettie Perez:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the headline Anna Karenina
[Italian Edition] suitable to you? Typically the book was written by famous writer in this era. Typically the
book untitled Anna Karenina [Italian Edition]is a single of several books which everyone read now. This
book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new shape
that you ever know prior to. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, and so all of people can
easily to recognise the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world
now. So that you can see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Judy Newberry:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when compared
with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find e-book that need more time to
be learn. Anna Karenina [Italian Edition] can be your answer as it can be read by a person who have those
short time problems.
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