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Alda Merini is one of Italy's most important, and most beloved, living poets. She has won many of the major
national literary prizes and has twice been nominated for the Nobel Prize--by the French Academy in 1996
and by Italian PEN in 2001. In Love Lessons, the distinguished American poet Susan Stewart brings us the
largest and most comprehensive selection of Merini's poetry to appear in English. Complete with the original
Italian on facing pages, a critical introduction, and explanatory notes, this collection gathers lyrics,
meditations, and aphorisms that span fifty years, from Merini's first books of the 1950s to an unpublished
poem from 2001. These accessible and moving poems reflect the experiences of a writer who, after
beginning her career at the center of Italian Modernist circles when she was a teenager, went silent in her
twenties, spending much of the next two decades in mental hospitals, only to reemerge in the 1970s to a full
renewal of her gifts, an outpouring of new work, and great renown.

Whether she is working in the briefest, most incisive lyric mode or the complex time schemes of longer
meditations, Merini's deep knowledge of classical and Christian myth gives her work a universal,
philosophical resonance, revealing what is at heart her tragic sense of life. At the same time, her ironic wit,
delight in nature, and affection for her native Milan underlie even her most harrowing poems of suffering. In
Stewart's skillful translations readers will discover a true sibyl of the twentieth and twenty-first centuries.
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From reader reviews:

Danny Exum:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name Love Lessons:
Selected Poems of Alda Merini (Facing Pages) suitable to you? The book was written by renowned writer in
this era. Often the book untitled Love Lessons: Selected Poems of Alda Merini (Facing Pages)is the one of
several books in which everyone read now. This book was inspired many people in the world. When you
read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know before. The author
explained their thought in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to comprehend the core of this book.
This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world with this book.

Charles Valentine:

The reserve with title Love Lessons: Selected Poems of Alda Merini (Facing Pages) has lot of information
that you can discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is
important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout
new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read the item
anywhere you want.

Sophia Myers:

Typically the book Love Lessons: Selected Poems of Alda Merini (Facing Pages) has a lot info on it. So
when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very famous
author. Tom makes some research just before write this book. That book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after perusing this book.

Susan Bondurant:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Love Lessons: Selected Poems of Alda Merini
(Facing Pages) book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who else read the book. Written with good manner for you, still dripping wet every
ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation Love
Lessons: Selected Poems of Alda Merini (Facing Pages) as good book not merely by the cover but also from
the content. This is one book that can break don't determine book by its cover, so do you still needing one
more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you
have to listening to another sixth sense.
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