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Kip has the worst case of acne that anyone has ever seen. Zits cover his entire body; his skin is aflame with
bright red, pus-filled sores. He has become an outcast in his school and the other kids call him Toad.

But what they don't know is the pus leaking from Kip's acne is actually a powerful narcotic that produces
strong psychedelic effects. Soon, everyone in school will want a taste of his hallucinogenic cream and this
former-loser will become the most popular kid in school. But once you lick the Toad, there's no going back
to normal drugs. His classmates just can't get enough. And as their addiction grows, they will stop at nothing
to get it...

In the spirit of Street Trash and Class of Nukem' High comes a novel about growing up, finding yourself, and
tripping on bodily fluids. Shane McKenzie and Eraserhead Press present a bizarro high school drama
drenched in Technicolor-splatter!
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From reader reviews:

Marisa Carney:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the reserve entitled Pus Junkies. Try to the actual book Pus Junkies as your close
friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you really feel alone and beside that course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you more confidence
because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let me make new experience along with knowledge
with this book.

Blake Westerman:

In other case, little men and women like to read book Pus Junkies. You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a new book Pus Junkies. You can add
knowledge and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book
you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe
searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library.
Let's examine.

Kristopher Lewis:

The book Pus Junkies can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why
must we leave the best thing like a book Pus Junkies? Some of you have a different opinion about
publication. But one aim in which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to
closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other;
you could share all of these. Book Pus Junkies has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can look the enormous world by wide open and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Vanessa Gilliam:

With this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you are related
is just spending your time little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the books in the
top listing in your reading list is definitely Pus Junkies. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry
Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upward and review this reserve you
can get many advantages.
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